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com.20210112.gappssmtp.comkeamanan: Enkripsi standar (TLS) Pelajari lebih lanjut:Penting menurut
keahlian Google.

Dear John Pahamzah

Thanks for your payment of your article ID : 1833-1JELLS. The bank informs us there is
a Beneficiary Account Name missing in payment details. So the bank is not going to
credit the amount in our account. So, you will need to visit your bank and correct

the Beneficiary Account Name: AESS Publications.

Bank Account Information:

Bank Name: MCB bank Limited

Swift Code: MUCBPKKA

Branch Code: 1106

Beneficiary Account Name: AESS Publications

Beneficiary Account No: 0664971441002149

IBAN: PKOBMUCB0664971441002149

Address: Shahi Road, Belgium Chowk, Rahim Yar Khan, Punjab.
Beneficiary Address: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200, Punjab, Pakistan

Country: Pakistan

I am waiting for your urgent reply.

David Paul

Editorial Office
AESS Publications
Email: status@aessweb.com

URL: www.aessweb.com

| hope your day is going great. Please find below the comments in the attached file. You
will need to make changes according to the comments.

Your paper's editing is completed. Please make your changes in blue color in order to
recheck.

Waiting for your revised file.


https://support.google.com/mail?hl=id&p=tls
mailto:status@aessweb.com
http://www.aessweb.com/

Dear John Pahamzah

We are going to publish your paper in the forthcoming issue of “IJELLS”. Please improve your
paper by changing the following:

1. Please check all the section numbers of the article.

2. Your paper abstract should not exceed 150 words

3. You should present from 6 to 10 keywords in the paper.

4. It is necessary to review the English (English must be improved).

5. Please provide the details of missing information in the references.

6. Please send us ORCID profile link of all authors. If you don’t have an ORCID profile, please
open the given link (www.orcid.org), create a profile and send us a link.

Please send us a revised file within 48 hours by including the above comments. Otherwise, your
paper will be pending for publication.

Note: We also require email ids and phone numbers of all authors and a picture of only
corresponding author. It's compulsory for our new format to add the picture of the corresponding
author. We are waiting for your reply.

| look forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,

On Sat, Aug 6, 2022 at 5:51 PM AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com> wrote:
Paper for Proofread: 1832-1JELLS

Dear Syafrizal Syafrizal

We are going to publish your paper in the forthcoming issue of “IJELLS”. Please improve your
paper by changing the following:

. Please check all the section numbers of the article.

. Your paper abstract should not exceed 150 words

. You should present from 6 to 10 keywords in the paper.

. Itis necessary to review the English (English must be improved).

. Please provide the details of missing information in the references.

. Please send us ORCID profile link of all authors. If you don’t have an ORCID profile, please
open the given link (www.orcid.org), create a profile and send us a link.
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Please send us a revised file within 48 hours by including the above comments. Otherwise, your
paper will be pending for publication.


http://www.orcid.org/
mailto:status@aessweb.com
http://www.orcid.org/

Note: We also require email ids and phone numbers of all authors and a picture of only
corresponding author. It's compulsory for our new format to add the picture of the corresponding
author. We are waiting for your reply.

| look forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,

On Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 3:34 PM Syafrizal Syafrizal <syafrizal@untirta.ac.id> wrote:
Thanks a lot.

On Wed, Aug 3, 2022, 4:26 PM AESS Journal <status@aessweb.com> wrote:

Thanks for your email. I have received your payment proofs and revised files.
Now your papers are in the production process. Soon you will receive the
formatted copy for proofreading.

If you require further information, please do not hesitate to write to me.

With Best Regards,

On Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 8:27 AM Syafrizal Syafrizal <syafrizal@untirta.ac.id> wrote:
Dear AESS,

| want to confirm you that | have paid for the journal today, 3rd August 2022, you can
see the receipt, revised paper, and the Turnitin. There are some important notes that
you have to know:

1. The title of my article "Enhancing Intensive Listening for Efl Indonesian Learners
through Busuu Application, the author will be Syafrizal Syafrizal, (see the paper)

2. The second title: Correlational Study Between Learning Habits and Learning

Achievement of Students at Indonesian Vocational High School.. The Author will be
John Pahamzah (You can see the paper)

Best regards

Dr. Syafrizal

David Paul
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jhon/ E)ahamzah <jhon.pahamzah@untirta.ac.id>

Sir ada email ini sir....
2 Lampiran ¢ Dipindai dengan Gmail

jhon/ E)ahamzah <jhon.pahamzah@untirta.ac.id>

kepada AESS

Thank you so much for the information and guidance...
We will do it soon

Warm regards

Dr. John Pahamzah ‘ '
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