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Cep Jandi Anwar:

Thank you for submitting the manuscript, "Response of Exchange Rate to Monetary Policy Shocks: An Evidence
from Indonesia " to International Journal of Economics and Finance Studies. With the online journal management
system that we are using, you will be able to track its progress through the editorial process by logging in to the
journal web site:

Submission URL: https://sobiad.info/index.php/ijefs/authorDashboard/submission/989
Username: cepjandianwar

If you have any questions, please contact me. Thank you for considering this journal as a venue for your work.
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Cep Jandi Anwar, Nicholas Okot, Indra Suhendra, Santa Yolanda, Rah Adi Fahmi Ginanjar, Hady Sutjipto:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to International Journal of Economics and Finance
Studies, "Response of Exchange Rate to Monetary Policy Shocks: An Evidence from Indonesia ".

Our decision is: Revisions Required

Reviewer A and B:
Abstract

e Add some statement of the problem.
Introduction

e Cite source of literature:

The literature suggests that monetary policy is more effective in stabilization of the exchange rate shock in
developing countries like Indonesia compared with their advanced or industrialized countries counterparts.

There is no need to add findings in the last paragraph of this section.
Add some theory point of view which have the same concept.

Add some background about this study.

Add some statistical facts and figures.

Literature Review

¢ Kindly add methodology and data analysis techniques of previous studies in literature.
e Add novelty of the study.

Methodology

e Add conceptual framework for better understanding.
e Try to add table which explain the details description of the variables.
o Cite previous studies which used the same variables.

Results

Where is Table 17?

Where is Table 5?

Why used real exchange rate instead of nominal exchange rate?
| think there is a need to correction in numbering of tables.

Conclusion
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e Conclude results according to the objectives.
e Add suggestions for further studies.

References
e Follow APA style in text citations and references list.

Recommendation: Accept Submission
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Dear Authors

We need complete list of authors, affiliations, email address and ORCID IDs of all the authors. Please provide as
soon as possible.

Regards
Editorial Team
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25K
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To: editorial@sobiad.org
Dear Editorial Team,

| hope this email finds you well.
Find the attached file of the list of authors of our manuscript.

Thank you very much.
Best regards,

Cep Jandi Anwar
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Please find the attachments to get acceptance letter and payment invoice. Please make the payment within 3
days.

Regards
Editorial Team
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To: Cep Jandi Anwar <cepjandianwar@untirta.ac.id>

Dear Authors
Please find the attachment to get corrected acceptance letter. In the previous acceptance letter the publication

date is wrong.

Regards
Editorial Team

On 2022-05-16 20:46, Cep Jandi Anwar wrote:
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To: editorial@sobiad.org
Dear Editorial Team,

Thank you very much for accepting our paper in the International Journal of Economics and Finance Studies.
Please find attached a file proof of payment for our publication.

Thank you very much.
Best regards,

Cep Jandi Anwar
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Dear Authors
Thanks for your payment. Your paper will be published within 30 days.
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Editorial Team
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Dear Authors
Your paper was published.
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